
OVERVIEW: 

Natta was appointed to deliver the full infrastructure package 
required to enable the development of a new crematorium facility to 
serve Maldon and the surrounding areas. The works were critical in 
preparing the site for the construction of the crematorium building, 
and its associated amenities. 
 

 

SCOPE OF WORKS: 
 

Our scope included the construction of a new S278 access 
bellmouth, providing safe and direct entry to the site from the public 
road. It was delivered in compliance with local authority standards 
to ensure long-term durability and road safety. Within the site 
boundary, Natta constructed a new access road and car park to 
facilitate efficient traffic movement and provide adequate parking 
capacity for visitors and staff. These elements were built to 
accommodate ceremonial vehicles and larger traffic volumes 
typically associated with such facilities. 

Substructure works included the formation of reinforced concrete 
foundations for the new crematorium building and separate plant 
building. The project also encompassed comprehensive drainage 
works, including both foul and surface water management. 
Significant earthworks were undertaken to prepare and level the 
site. Additional responsibilities included BWIC, street lighting 
installations, and the coordination of works to integrate seamlessly 
with the crematorium construction. 

This project demonstrates Natta’s expertise in delivering 
infrastructure schemes required for critical community facilities. 
Our ability to manage live interfaces, and maintain quality and 
safety standards have ensured successful delivery on time and to 
specification.   
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SECTOR: 

Civils 

 

OUR ROLE: 

Main Contractor 

 

LOCATION: 

Essex 

 

CLIENT: 

Elegy and Maldon Fields 

 

PROJECT VALUE: 

£1.8m 

 

DURATION: 

10 Months 

 

 

See next page for more 




